
From: Smyth, Stuart
To:  L [AG/5125]
Cc: Sawatzki, Laurel
Subject: RE: Invoice for Program Support
Date: Friday, May 13, 2016 11:27:00 AM

Hi 
 
I just spoke with Laurel Sawatzki, the college’s financial officer and she said the invoice either just
went out or will go out shortly.
 

 
Cheers,
Stuart
 

From:  L [AG/5125] [mailto @monsanto.com] 
Sent: Friday, May 13, 2016 10:25 AM
To: Smyth, Stuart <stuart.smyth@usask.ca>
Subject: Invoice for Program Support
 
Stuart,
 
Any idea on timing of when we can expect an invoice for this year’s contribution?  I need to slot it
into a budget month.
 
Thanks,
 

 

Public and Industry Affairs Director
 
Monsanto Canada Inc.
900 - One Research Road 
Winnipeg, Manitoba  R3T 6E3

 
 
If you no longer wish to receive commercial electronic communications from Monsanto Canada,
please click here to unsubscribe 
 



 
 
This email and any attachments were sent from a Monsanto email account and 
may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the 
intended recipient, please contact the sender and delete this email and any 
attachments immediately. Any unauthorized use, including disclosing, 
printing, storing, copying or distributing this email, is prohibited. All 
emails and attachments sent to or from Monsanto email accounts may be subject 
to monitoring, reading, and archiving by Monsanto, including its affiliates 
and subsidiaries, as permitted by applicable law. Thank you.
 
 


