From: Chassy, Bruce

To: ESHN-General
Subject: Fwd: Travel and Accounts
Date: Friday, October 22, 2010 8:40:39 AM

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Chassy, Bruce" <bchassy@uiuc.edu>
Date: October 20, 2010 6:09:36 PM CDT

To: Gregory J Knott <gknott63@illinois.edu>
Cc: Faye L Dong <fayedong@illinois.edu>
Subject: Travel and Accounts

Hi Greg,

I am going to be filling out a travel request form for a trip to Korea and Russia
that [ am going to make in November. In Seoul I will be visiting The Korea FDA
for two days and then I will fly on to Vladivostok Russia to visit Pacific State
University to give a series of lectures.

The reason I am writing is this. Most of my expenses will be paid by my hosts so
I don't need to buy tickets and most hotels are covered. I will, however, need to
be able to pay for two nights of hotel in Seoul Korea from my Biotech Account.

That account has had a zero balance for a while and can't be charged to at the
moment. I have been informed by Monsanto that they are going to make a
substantial contribution to my UIFoundation Biotech account in the next 30-60
days. There should be sufficient funds to by a good margin to cover the Korean
hotels.

I just wanted to alert you to all of this in advance so that you know how I intend
to pay for the hotels when I make the travel request.

Let me know if there are any questions
Regards

Bruce



